As INTRODUCED IN LOK SABHA

Bill No. 28 of 2020

THE AIRCRAFT (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020
A
BILL
further to amend the Aircraft Act, 1934.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—
1. This Act may be called the Aircraft (Amendment) Act, 2020. Short title.
XXII of 1934. 2. Inthe Aircraft Act, 1934 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 2,— Amendment
of section 2.

5 (a) after clause (7), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

'(1A) "Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau" means the Aircraft
Accidents Investigation Bureau constituted under section 4C;';

(b) after clause (2A), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

'(2B) "Bureau of Civil Aviation Security" means the Bureau of Civil
10 Aviation Securityconstituted under section 4B;

(2C) "Directorate General of Civil Aviation" means the Directorate General
of Civil Aviation constituted under section 4A;'.



Substitution of
new sections
4A, 4B, 4C
and 4D for
section 4A.

Directorate
General of
Civil Aviation.

Bureau of
Civil Aviation
Security.

Aircraft
Accidents
Investigation
Bureau.

Superintendence
of Central
Government.

2

3. For section 4A of the principal Act, the following sections shall be substituted,

namely:—

"4A. (I) The Central Government may constitute a body to be known as the
Directorate General of Civil Aviation, which shall be headed by an officer designated
as the Director General of Civil Aviation to be appointed in this behalf by the Central
Government by notification in the Official Gazette.

(2) The Directorate General of Civil Aviation shall be responsible for carrying
out the safety oversight and regulatory functions in respect of matters specified in
this Act or the rules made thereunder.

(3) The administration of the Directorate General of Civil Aviation shall vest in
the Director General of Civil Aviation.

(4) The Central Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette,
direct that any power exercisable by the Director General of Civil Aviation may also be
exercisable by any other officer or authority specially empowered in this behalf by the
Central Government.

4B. (I) The Central Government may constitute a body to be known as the
Bureau of Civil Aviation Security, which shall be headed by an officer designated as
the Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security to be appointed in this behalf
by the Central Government by notification in the Official Gazette.

(2) The Bureau of Civil Aviation Security shall be responsible for carrying out
the regulatory and oversight functions in respect of matters relating to civil aviation
security specified in this Act or the rules made thereunder.

(3) The administration of the Bureau of Civil Aviation Security shall vest in the
Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security.

(4) The Central Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette,
direct that any power exercisable by the Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation
Security may also be exercisable by any other officer or authority specially empowered
in this behalf by the Central Government.

4C. (1) The Central Government may constitute a body to be known as the
Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau, which shall be headed by an officer
designated as the Director General of Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau to be
appointed in this behalf by the Central Government by notification in the Official
Gazette.

(2) The Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau shall be responsible for carrying
out the functions in respect of matters relating to investigation of aircraft accidents or
incidents specified in this Act or the rules made thereunder.

(3) The administration of the Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau shall vest
in the Director General of Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau.

(4) The Central Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette,
direct that any power exercisable by the Director General of Aircraft Accidents
Investigation Bureau may also be exercisable by any other officer or authority specially
empowered in this behalf by the Central Government.

4D. The superintendence of the Directorate General of Civil Aviation, the Bureau
of Civil Aviation Security and the Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau shall vest
in the Central Government, which shall have the power to issue directions to each of
these organisations, on any matters falling under sub-section (2) of sections 4A, 4B
and 4C, respectively, if it considers necessary and expedient so to do in the public
interest.".

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45



3

4. In section 5 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),—

(i) after clause (gc), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

"(gd) the regulation of air navigation services, that is, aeronautical
information services, aeronautical charting and cartography services,
aeronautical meteorological services, search and rescue services, procedure
for air navigation services and aircraft operations other than those referred to in
clause (gb) and any other matter relating to air navigation services;";

(if) clause (gq) shall be relettered as clause (ga) thereof and in clause (ga) as so

relettered, the word "and" occurring at the end shall be omitted;

10

(iii) after clause (ga), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—
"(gb) safety oversight and regulatory functions;

(qc) regulatory and oversight functions in respect of matters relating to
civil aviation security; and".

5. In section 5A of the principal Act,—

15

(gq)"

(7) in sub-section (1), for the brackets, letters and word "(gc), (h), (i), (m) and

, the brackets, letters and word "(gc), (gd), (h), (i), (m), (qa) and (gb)" shall be

substituted;

20

25

30

35

(if) after sub-section (/), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

"(1A) The Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or any
other officer specially empowered in this behalf by the Central Government
may, from time to time, by order, issue directions, consistent with the provisions
of this Act and the rules made thereunder, with respect to any of the matters
specified in clauses (e), (f), (gc) and (gc) of sub-section (2) of section 5, to any
person or persons using any aerodrome, or engaged in the aircraft operations,
air traffic control, maintenance and operation of aerodrome, or safeguarding
civil aviation against acts of unlawful interference, in any case where the Director
General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or such other officer is satisfied
that in the interests of the security of India or to ensure security of civil
aviation operations, it is necessary so to do.

(I/B) On receipt of a representation from any person or otherwise, if it
considers necessary and expedient to do so in the public interest, the Central
Government may review any order passed under sub-section (/) or
sub-section (/A) and issue directions to the Director General of Civil Aviation
or Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security, as the case may be, to
rescind or modify such order.";

(iii) in sub-section (2), after the word, brackets and figure "sub-section (/)", the

words, brackets, figures and letters "or sub-section (/A) or sub-section (/B)" shall be
inserted.

6. In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (/A) ,—

40

(i) for the word, brackets and letters "clause (gq)", the word, brackets and

letters "clause (ga)"shall be substituted;

(i) for the words "ten lakh rupees" wherever they occur, the words "one crore

rupees” shall be substituted.

7. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be inserted,

45 namely:—

"10A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2) of section 10,

the Central Government may, in making any rule under section 4, 5,7, 8, 8 A or section 8B,

Amendment
of section 5.

Amendment
of section 5A.

Amendment
of section 10.

Insertion of
new
sections10A
and 10B.

Adjudication
of penalties.



Cancellation
of licence or
certificate or
approval.

Amendment
of section 11.

Amendment of
section 11A.

Amendment of
section 11B.

Insertion of
new sections
12A and 12B.

Composition
of offences.

4

provide for imposition of penalty not exceeding rupees one crore for the contravention
of any rule for which no other punishment has been provided elsewhere in the Act, or
in the rules made thereunder, for such contravention.

(2) The Central Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette,
appoint such number of officers not below the rank of Deputy Secretary to the
Government of India or equivalent, as it considers necessary, to be designated officers
for adjudging penalty under sub-section (7), in such manner as the Central Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, make rules.

(3) The Central Government may, while appointing designated officers under
sub-section (2), also specify their jurisdiction in that order.

(4) Where the designated officer is satisfied that any contravention of the
provisions of the rules has been committed by any person, he may, by an order in
writing, impose penalty on such person stating the nature of contravention, the
provision of rules which has been contravened and the reasons for imposing such
penalty:

Provided that the designated officer shall, before imposing any penalty, give a
reasonable opportunity of being heard to such person.

(5) Any person aggrieved by an order made under sub-section (4) may prefer
an appeal to an appellate officer having jurisdiction in the matter who is next higher in
rank to the designated officer who has passed such order.

(6) Every appeal under sub-section (5) shall be filed within thirty days from the
date on which the copy of the order made by the designated officer is received by the
aggrieved person and shall be in such form and manner, and be accompanied by such
fees, as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, make
rules.

(7) The appellate officer may, after giving the parties to the appeal an opportunity
of being heard, pass such order as he thinks fit, confirming, modifying or setting
aside the order appealed against.

10B. Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, if any person contravenes
any of the provisions of this Act or the rules made thereunder, the licence, certificate
or approval issued to such person under this Act may be suspended or cancelled in
such manner as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
make rules.".

8. In section 11 of the principal Act, for the words "ten lakh rupees”, the words

"one crore rupees" shall be substituted.

9. In section 11A of the principal Act, for the words "ten lakh rupees”, the words

"one crore rupees" shall be substituted.

10. In section 11B of the principal Act, in sub-section (/), for the words

"ten lakh rupees", the words "one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

11. After section 12 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be inserted,

namely:—

"12A.(I) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973, any offence punishable under sections 10,11,11A,11B and section
12 or under any rules made thereunder, may be compounded, either before or after the
institution of any prosecution, by the Director General of Civil Aviation or Director
General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or Director General of Aircraft Accidents
Investigation Bureau, as the case may be, in such manner as the Central Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, make rules.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

2 of 1974.

45



2 of 1974.

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

5

(2) Nothing contained in sub-section (/) shall apply to an offence committed
by a person for the second time or thereafter within a period of five years from the
date of commission of a similar offence which was earlier compounded or for which
such person was earlier convicted.

(3) Every officer referred to in sub-section (/) shall exercise the powers to
compound an offence, subject to the direction, control and supervision of the Central
Government.

(4) Every application for the compounding of an offence shall be made in such
manner as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, make
rules.

(5) Where any offence is compounded before the institution of any prosecution,
no prosecution shall be instituted in relation to such offence by an officer referred to
in sub-section (/) against the offender in relation to whom the offence is so
compounded.

(6) Where the composition of any offence is made after the institution of any
prosecution, such composition shall be brought to the notice of the court in which
the prosecution is pending, in writing, by the officer referred to in sub-section (/), and
on such notice of the composition of the offence being given, the person against
whom the offence is so compounded shall be discharged.

(7) The composition of an offence under this section shall have the effect of an
acquittal of the accused with whom the offence has been compounded.

(8) No offence specified in sub-section (/) shall be compounded except as
provided in this section.

12B. (I) No court shall take cognizance of any offence punishable under this
Act, save on a complaint made by or with the previous sanction in writing by the
Director General of Civil Aviation or Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation
Security or Director General of Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau, as the case
may be.

(2) The complaint referred to in sub-section (/) shall be made within a period of
one year from the date on which the offence came to the knowledge of the Director
General of Civil Aviation or Director General of Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or
Director General of Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau, as the case may be.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973, no court inferior to that of a Metropolitan Magistrate or Magistrate
of the first class shall try the offences under this Act.".

12. In section 19 of the principal Act, in sub-section (/),—

(a) after the words "or air forces of the Union", the words "or other armed
forces of the Union constituted by any law for the time being in force" shall be
inserted;

(D) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

"Provided that any aircraft belonging to an armed force of the Union
other than naval, military or air forces of the Union, for which the provisions of
this Act and the rules made thereunder are applicable on the date of
commencement of the Aircraft (Amendment) Act, 2020, shall continue to be so
governed by this Act and the rules made thereunder till such date as the Central
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify.".

Cognizance of
offences.

Amendment
of section 19.



Transitional
provisions
relating to
existing
Authorities.

6

13. Anything done, or any action or decision taken, or any order or direction issued,
by any authority set up pursuant to the provisions of the principal Act or rules made
thereunder, prior to the date of coming into force of this Act, shall, insofar as such action or
decision or direction are relatable to the functions of the Directorate General of Civil Aviation
or the Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or the Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau, as
the case may be, shall be deemed to have been done or taken or issued by the Directorate
General of Civil Aviation or the Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or the Aircraft Accidents
Investigation Bureau, as the case may be, constituted under sections 4A, 4B and 4C,
respectively, of this Act.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Aircraft Act, 1934 (the Act) was enacted to make better provision for the control of
the manufacture, possession, use, operation, sale, import and export of aircraft. It makes
provisions for securing the safety of aircraft operations in India and carrying out civil aviation
operations as per the internationally accepted standards, procedures and practices as laid
down by the International Civil Aviation Organisation (ICAO).

2. The ICAO, under its Universal Safety Oversight Audit Programme and the Universal
Security Audit Programme, conducts regular safety and security audits of all the countries
which are signatory to the Chicago Convention to ensure that the signatories are fulfilling
their obligation of safety and security oversight functions. The Federal Aviation
Administration of the United States of America also conducts safety audits of countries
whose airlines operate to the United States of America under its International Aviation
Safety Assessment Programme. India, as a signatory, is also subjected to such periodical
audits by ICAO and Federal Aviation Administration.

3. The audit conducted by the ICAO in the years 2012 and 2015 have indicated a need
to amend the Act to give proper recognition to the regulators under the Act, to enhance the
maximum quantum of fines and to empower the departmental officers to impose financial
penalties on individuals or organisations involved in violations of the legal provisions and
to include certain areas of air navigation services for rule making purpose under section 5 of
the Act.

4. Further, based on the repeated requests from Border Security Force for exemption
under rule 160 of the Aircraft Rules, 1937, a need was felt to keep the aircraft and personnel
of Border Security Force or any other armed forces of the Union operating such aircraft,
outside the purview of the Act from such date the Government may decide.

5. The Aircraft (Amendment) Bill, 2020 which seeks to give effect to the aforementioned
decisions, inter alia, provides for the following, namely:—

(a) to define the expressions "Directorate General of Civil Aviation", "Bureau of
Civil Aviation Security" and "Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau";

(b) toempower the Central Government to constitute the Directorate General of
Civil Aviation, Bureau of Civil Aviation Security and Aircraft Accidents Investigation
Bureau under the Act and to specify their responsibilities thereof;

(c) to empower the Central Government to issue directions to the Directorate
General of Civil Aviation, Bureau of Civil Aviation Security and Aircraft Accidents
Investigation Bureau on any matter if it is considered necessary so to do in public
interest;

(d) to empower the Central Government to review any order passed by the
Director General of Civil Aviation and the Director General of Civil Aviation Security
and also direct them to rescind or modify such order;

(e) toinclude regulation of all areas of air navigation services;

(f) toempower the Bureau of Civil Aviation Security or any authorised officer to
issue directions;

(g) toenhance the maximum limit of fine from the existing ten lakh rupees to one
crore rupees;

(h) to appoint designated officers for adjudging penalties;

(i) to provide for compounding of offences;



8

(j) tokeep aircraft belonging to any armed forces of the Union other than naval,
military or air force outside the purview of the Act.

6. The Bill seeks to achieve the above objects.

NEw DELHI; HARDEEP SINGH PURL
The 22nd January, 2020.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Bill if enacted, would not involve any expenditure either recurring or non-recurring
from the Consolidated Fund of India.



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 7 of the Bill proposes to insert a new section 10A. Sub-section (2) of the said
section empowers the Central Government to appoint by order published in the Official
Gazette such number of officers not below the rank of Deputy Secretary to the Government
of India or equivalent, as it considers necessary, to be designated officers for adjudging
penalty under sub-section (/), in such manner as it may provide by rules. Sub-section (6) of
the said section further empowers the Central Government to provide by rules the form,
manner and fees to be accompanied with in respect of appeals to be filed under
sub-section (5). The said clause further proposes to insert a new section 10B, which empowers
the Central Government to make rules to provide for the manner of suspension or cancellation
of the licence, certificate or approval issued to any person under the Act, if such person
contravenes any of the provisions of the Act or the rules made thereunder.

2. Clause 11 of the Bill proposes to insert a new section 12A, which empowers the
Central Government to make rules to provide for the manner in which offences punishable
under sections 10,11,11A,11B and section 12 of the Act or under any rules made thereunder,
shall be compounded by the Director General of Civil Aviation or Director General of Bureau
of Civil Aviation Security or Director General of Aircraft Accidents Investigation Bureau, as
the case may be. Sub-section (4) of the said section further empowers the Central Government
to make rules to provide for the manner in which every application for compounding of an
offence shall be made.

3. The matters in respect of which rules may be made under the proposed legislation
are matters of procedure or administrative details and it is not practicable to provide for them
in the Bill itself. The delegation of legislative power is, therefore, of a normal character.

10



2 of 1974.

ANNEXURE
EXTRACTS FROM THE AIRCRAFT (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1934

(22 oF 1934)

* * * *k &

4A. The Director General of Civil Aviation or any other officer specially empowered in
this behalf by the Central Government shall perform the safety oversight functions in respect
of matters specified in this Act or the rules made thereunder.

5.(])* * & * &

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing power, such rules may provide
for—

* * * *k &

(gq) the prohibition of slaughtering and flaying of animals and of depositing
rubbish, filth and other polluted and obnoxious matter within a radius, of ten kilometres
from the aerodrome reference point; and

* * * *k &

5A. (1) The Director General of Civil Aviation or any other officer specially empowered
in this behalf by the Central Government may, from time to time, by order, issue directions,
consistent with the provisions of this act and the rules made thereunder, with respect to any
of the matters specified, in [clauses (aa), (b), (¢), (e), (f), (2), (ga), (gb), (gc), (h), (i), (m) and
(qq) of sub-section (2) of section 5, to any person or persons using any aerodrome or
engaged in the aircraft operations, air traffic control, maintenance and operation of aerodrome,
communication, navigation, surveillance and air traffic management facilities and safeguarding
civil aviation against acts of unlawful interference], in any case where the Director General of
Civil Aviation or such other officer is satisfied that in the interests of the security of India or
for securing the safety of aircraft operations it is necessary so to do.

(2) Every direction issued under sub-section (/) shall be complied with by the person
or persons to whom such direction is issued.

* * * * *

10. (1) If any person contravenes any provision of any rule made under clause (/) of
sub-section (2) of section 5 prohibiting or regulating the carriage in aircraft of arms, explosives
or other dangerous goods, or when required under the rules made under that clause to give
information in relation to any such goods gives information which is false and which he
either knows or believes to be false or does not believe to be true he, and if he is not the
owner, the owner also (unless the owner proves that the offence was committed without his
knowledge, consent or connivance) shall be punishable with imprisonment which may extend
to two years and shall also be liable to fine which may extend to ten lakh rupees.

(IA) If any person contravenes any provision of any rule made under clause (gq) of
sub-section (2) of section 5 prohibiting the slaughter and flaying of animals and of depositing
rubbish, filth and other polluted and obnoxious matters within a radious of ten kilometres
from the aerodrome reference point, he shall be punishable with imprisonment which may
extend to three years, or with fine which may extend to ten lakh rupees, or with both.

(IB) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 an
offence referred to in sub-section (/A) shall be cognizable.

(2) In making any other rule under section 5 or in making any rule under section 4,
section 7, section 8, section 8A or section 8B, the Central Government may direct that a

11

Safety
oversight
functions.

Power of
Central
Government
to make rules.

Power to issue
directions.

Penalty for
act in
contravention
of rule made
under this Act.



Penalty for
flying so as to
cause danger.

Penalty for
failure to
comply with
directions
issued under
section SA.

Penalty for
failure to
comply with
directions
issued under
section 9A.

Saving of
application of
Act.

12

breach of it shall be punishable with imprisonment for a period which may extend to two
years, or with fine which may extend to ten lakh rupees, or with both.

11. Whoever wilfully flies any aircraft in such a manner as to cause danger to any
person or to any property on land or water or in the air shall be punishable with imprisonment
for a term which may extend to two years, or with fine which may extend to ten lakh rupees,
or with both.

11A. If any person wilfully fails to comply with any direction issued under section 5A,
he shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years or with
fine which may extend to one thousand rupees, or with both.

11B. (/) If any person wilfully fails to comply with any direction contained in any
notification issued under section 9A, he shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to two years, or with fine which may extend to ten lakh rupees, or with
both.

* * * *k &

19. (1) Nothing in this Act or in any order or rule made thereunder other than a rule
made under section 8A or under section 8B shall apply to or in respect of any aircraft
belonging to or exclusively employed in the naval, military or air forces of the Union, or to
any person in such forces employed in connection with such aircraft.

(2) Nothing in this Act or in any order or rule made thereunder shall apply to or in
respect of any lighthouse to which the Indian Lighthouse Act, 1927 applies or prejudice or
affect any right or power exercisable by any authority under that Act.

* * * *k &

19 of 1927.



LOK SABHA

A

BILL
further to amend the Aircraft Act, 1934.

(Shri Hardeep Singh Puri, Minister of State for Civil Aviation)

MGIPMRND—4913LS(S3)—29-01-2020.



LOK SABHA

CORRIGENDUM
to
THE AIRCRAFT (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020

[To be/As introduced in Lok Sabha]

1.  Pageb, line 34,-
for “Magistrate or Magistrate”

read “Magistrate or a Magistrate”

NEW DELHI,

31 January, 2019
Magha 11, 1941 (Saka)




	Aircraft (Amendment) Bill, 2020.pdf
	Aircraft corrigenda.pdf


<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


